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Philippians 1:3, I thank my God every time I 
remember you. 4 In all my prayers for all of you, I 
always pray with joy 5 because of your partnership in 
the gospel from the first day until now, 

Philippians 2:5, In your relationships with one 
another, have the same mindset as Christ Jesus: 

 
Why Is True Humility So Important? 

 
1. True Humility Brings HARMONY 

 
Philippians 2:1, Therefore if you have any 
encouragement from being united with Christ, if any 
comfort from his love, if any common sharing in the 
Spirit, if any tenderness and compassion, 2 then 
make my joy complete by being like-minded, having 
the same love, being one in spirit and of one mind. 
 
Ephesians 4:3, Make every effort to keep the unity of 
the Spirit through the bond of peace. 
 
Romans 15:5, May the God who gives endurance and 
encouragement give you the same attitude of mind 
toward each other that Christ Jesus had, 6 so that 
with one mind and one voice you may glorify the God 
and Father of our Lord Jesus Christ. 

 
2. True Humility Puts Others FIRST 

 

Philippians 2:3, Do nothing out of selfish ambition or 
vain conceit. Rather, in humility value others above 
yourselves, 4 not looking to your own interests but 
each of you to the interests of the others. 

 
Romans 12:10, Be devoted to one another in love. 
Honor one another above yourselves. 
 
Matthew 23:11, The greatest among you will be your 
servant. 12 For those who exalt themselves will be 
humbled, and those who humble themselves will be 
exalted. 

 
3. True Humility Reflects the Mind of CHRIST 

 
Philippians 2:5, In your relationships with one 
another, have the same mindset as Christ Jesus: 6 
Who, being in very nature God, did not consider 
equality with God something to be used to his own 
advantage; 7 rather, he made himself nothing by 
taking the very nature of a servant, being made in 
human likeness. 8 And being found in appearance 
as a man, he humbled himself by becoming 
obedient to death—even death on a cross! 

 
Colossians 2:9, For in Christ all the fullness of the 
Deity lives in bodily form, 10 and in Christ you have 
been brought to fullness. … 
 
Matthew 20:28, “… the Son of Man did not come to 
be served, but to serve, and to give his life as a 
ransom for many.” 
 
John 13:14, Now that I, your Lord and Teacher, have 
washed your feet, you also should wash one 



another’s feet. 15 I have set you an example that you 
should do as I have done for you. 

 
4. True Humility Leads to Your ELEVATION 

 
Philippians 2:9, Therefore God exalted him to the 
highest place and gave him the name that is above 
every name, 10 that at the name of Jesus every knee 
should bow, in heaven and on earth and under the 
earth, 11 and every tongue acknowledge that Jesus 
Christ is Lord, to the glory of God the Father. 

 
James 4:10, Humble yourselves before the Lord, and 
he will lift you up. 
 
1 Peter 5:6, Humble yourselves, therefore, under 
God’s mighty hand, that he may lift you up in due 
time. 


